
BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-335

  Title: Annual Disposal of Yard Waste, Class III and Construction Demolition Material

 Date: 11/26/2024

Bidder:

Angelos Recycled 

Materials

Republic Services of 

Florida, Limited 

Partnership

Consolidated 

Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 

Veransa Company

City & State: Lutz, FL Lakeland, FL Sarasota, FL

Disposal Site Address: 

1880 Fairbanks St 

Lakeland, FL 33805

2500 SR 60 W, Bartow, 

FL

6727 Cty Rd, 

Seffner, FL

A. Yard Waste (Clean) $45.00 $31.50 $40.00

B. Yard Waste (Clean in Plastic or Paper Bags) $45.00 $31.50 No Bid

C. Construction & Demolition Debris (C&D) $45.00 $31.50 No Bid

D. Class III Waste No Bid $31.50 No Bid

E. Tires No Bid No Bid No Bid

F. Tires w/ Rims No Bid No Bid No Bid

Additional Disposal Site Address:

41111 Enterprise Rd Dade 

City, FL 33525

3820 Maine Ave. 

Lakeland, FL

A. Yard Waste (Clean) $25.00 No Bid No Bid

B. Yard Waste (Clean in Plastic or Paper Bags) $25.00 No Bid No Bid

C. Construction & Demolition Debris (C&D) $25.00 No Bid No Bid
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-335

  Title: Annual Disposal of Yard Waste, Class III and Construction Demolition Material

 Date: 11/26/2024

Bidder:

Angelos Recycled 

Materials

Republic Services of 

Florida, Limited 

Partnership

Consolidated 

Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 

Veransa Company

City & State: Lutz, FL Lakeland, FL Sarasota, FL

D. Class III Waste $25.00 No Bid No Bid

E. Tires $115.00 $300.00 No Bid

F. Tires w/ Rims $215.00 No Bid No Bid
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