
BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

A. Flame Retardent Shirts

Manufacturer Item/Style Number Description Color Options to Stock Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ariat 10022327
Ariat Air Crew Long 

Sleeve Shirt

Charcoal, Navy Blue, 

Sand, Grey
$66.65 $67.40 $89.10 Disqualified

Carhartt
TK0235-FRM / 

100235

Carhartt Force Long 

Sleeve T-Shirt
Khaki, Navy Blue $70.55 $73.70 No Bid Disqualified

Carhartt 104138

Carhartt FR Force 

Loose Fit Long Sleeve 

Button Front Shirt

Tan, Navy, Grey $97.20 $111.70 No Bid Disqualified

Dragonwear 1467XX-XXXX
Dragonwear Highline 

Long Sleeve Shirt
Khaki $69.05 $89.95 No Bid Disqualified

Dragonwear 146413-749X

Dragonwear FR Pro 

Dry Tech Shirt with 

Hood

Gray, Navy Blue $125.90 $132.50 No Bid Disqualified

Dragonwear 146313-XXXX

Dragonwear FR Pro 

Dry Tech Long Sleeve 

Shirt

Gray, Navy Blue $109.45 $113.05 No Bid Disqualified

Drifire TEEY2LSPC3 Drifire Hi-Vis Pullover Hi-Vis $119.35 $126.05 No Bid Disqualified

LapCo FRT-HJE HV3
LapCo Hi-Vis FR Long 

Sleeve Henley
Hi-Vis $122.75 $135.10 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

LapCo IHV7C3
LapCo Hi-Vis Uniform 

Button Down Shirt
Hi-Vis $123.65 $120.25 No Bid Disqualified

Tecgen TCG011202
Tecgen Drifire FR Work 

Shirt
Tan, Grey, Navy Blue $91.80 $100.80 No Bid Disqualified

Tecgen TE011
Tecgen Select 5.5oz 

Dress Uniform Shirt
Tan, Navy, Grey $91.80 $100.80 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale K185B
Tyndale Button Down 

Shirt
Khaki $57.85 $73.70 No Bid Disqualified

Wrangler FR3W01

Wrangler Riggs 

Workwear FR Button 

Down Work Shirt

Gray, Khaki, Navy Blue $91.40 $101.25 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

B. Flame Retardent Pants

Manufacturer Item/Style Number Description Color Options to Stock Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ariat 10026002
Ariat M4 Relaxed 

Duralight Ripstop Pant
Navy Blue, Grey $126.60 $143.10 $132.30 Disqualified

Ariat 10012555
Ariat M4 Relaxed Basic 

Boot Cut  Jean
Flint, Shale, Alloy $85.05 $93.45 $87.41 Disqualified

Bulwark  PLC2
Bulwark Cargo Work 

Pant
Navy Blue $77.95 $78.15 $96.80 Disqualified

Carhartt FRB159

Carhartt Men's FRC 

Original Loose Fit 

Canvas Pant

Khaki, Moss, Navy 

Blue
$82.80 $95.25 No Bid Disqualified

LapCo P-INDM10
LapCo Modern FR 

Jean
Dirty Wash Denim $58.05 $68.20 No Bid Disqualified

LapCo P-BWCJ85KH
LapCo FR Canvas 

Work Pant

Khaki, Moss, Navy 

Blue
$82.75 $79.05 No Bid Disqualified

Tecgen PNTD6JTR Tecgen Taproom Jean Denim $101.55 $117.60 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale F290T
Tyndale Broken-In 

Relaxed Jean
Denim $58.05 $89.85 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

Tyndale M295T

Tyndale 

Summerweight Canvas 

Pant

Khaki, Navy Blue, Olive $86.25 $98.00 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale M24MT
Tyndale Versa Regular 

Fit Flex FR Jeans
Dark Denim $76.10 $101.60 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale K215T
Tyndale Utility Cargo 

Pant
Khaki, Navy Blue $59.90 $86.25 No Bid Disqualified

Wrangler FR42MWD
Wrangler 20X Vintage 

Boot Jean
Denim $69.25 $74.50 No Bid Disqualified

Wrangler FR31MWZ
Wrangler FR Relaxed 

Fit Jean
Pre Wash Denim $66.25 $72.95 No Bid Disqualified

Wrangler FR13MWZ
Wrangler FR Original 

Fit Jean

Prewash Denim, Stone 

Wash
$66.25 $72.95 No Bid Disqualified

Wrangler FR36MWZ
Wrangler Men's Slim 

Fit FR Jean
Demin $66.25 $73.75 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

C. Flame Retardent Outerwear

Manufacturer Item/Style Number Description Color Options to Stock Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ariat 10022333
Ariat FR Rev 1/4 Zip 

Top Jacket

Black, Charcoal, Navy 

Blue, Silver Fox 

Heather

$98.65 $106.20 $122.85 Disqualified

Ariat 10034731
Ariat 2.0 Insulated FR 

Bib Overall
Black, Khaki, Navy $251.55 $288.85 $278.10 Disqualified

Ariat 10024027 Ariat FR Vernon Jacket Black $227.90 $255.25 $254.48 Disqualified

Ariat 10027865
Ariat Duralight Stretch 

Canvas FR Jacket
Iron, Navy Blue $227.90 $251.00 $254.48 Disqualified

Bulwark JLH6

Bulwark FR Brown 

Duck Hooded Jacket 

w/ Knit Trim

Brown $218.40 $224.80 $290.18 Disqualified

Bulwark JLH4

Bulwark FR Brown 

Duck Hooded Jacket 

w/ Lanyard Access on 

Back

Brown $212.95 $221.20 $286.47 Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

Bulwark SEH4
Bulwark Zip Front 

Sweatshirt

Charcoal, Navy Blue, 

Orange
$182.75 $188.00 $249.62 Disqualified

Bulwark SEZ4

Bulwark Full Zip-Front 

Hooded Waffle-Lined 

Sweatshirt

Navy Blue $218.05 $223.90 $289.78 Disqualified

Carhartt 104982

Carhartt FR Force 

Midweight Hooded 

Front Zip Sweatshirt

Carhartt Brown, 

Granite Heather, Navy 

Blue

$125.85 $155.60 No Bid Disqualified

Carhartt 102869 Carhartt FR Knit Hat Navy Blue $26.35 $41.35 No Bid Disqualified

Carhartt 104981
Carhartt FR Duck 

Sherpa Lined Vest

Carhartt Brown, Dark 

Navy
$125.15 $147.50 No Bid Disqualified

Carhartt 102691
Carhartt FR Quick 

Duck Lined Bib Overall
Brown, Dark Navy $243.20 $294.00 No Bid Disqualified

Dragonwear 313313-7499
Dragonwear 19" Shape 

Shift Neck Tube
Gray $35.10 $35.05 No Bid Disqualified

Dragonwear 303510-7499
Dragonwear Big Chill 

Fleece Beanie
Black, Navy Blue $39.90 $34.10 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale K690T
Tyndale FR 

Heavyweight Vest
Brown, Navy Blue $139.25 $139.30 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

Tyndale K669T
Tyndale Three Season 

Active FR Jacket
Navy Blue $137.70 $194.15 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale M710T
Tyndale Crewneck 

Sweatshirt
Navy Blue $155.15 $126.15 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale M721T
Tyndale Front Hooded 

Sweatshirt
Navy Blue $182.75 $168.15 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale M701T
Tyndale Pullover 

Hooded Sweatshirt

Grey, Navy Blue, 

Orange
$116.80 $158.95 No Bid Disqualified

Tyndale M956T
Tyndale Single Ply 

Balaclava
Navy Blue $27.00 $34.10 No Bid Disqualified

Wrangler FR171XX
Wrangler FR Pullover 

Hoodie
Black, Navy Blue $138.10 $158.95 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

D. Non-Fire Retardent Shirts

Manufacturer Item/Style Number Description Color Options to Stock Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Bayside 8100

100% Cotton Long 

Sleeve T Shirt w/ 

pocket

Orange, Sand $27.00 $24.05 No Bid Disqualified

Gildan G5000

100% Cotton Short 

Sleeve T Shirt no 

pocket

Orange, Sand $10.85 $11.45 No Bid Disqualified

Gildan G2300

100% Cotton Short 

Sleeve T Shirt w/ 

pocket

Orange, Sand $17.40 $16.85 No Bid Disqualified

Bayside 5060

100% Cotton Long 

Sleeve T Shirt no 

pocket

Orange, Sand $23.40 No Bid No Bid Disqualified

Kishigo
Hi Vis Long Sleeve 

Shirt with pocket
Lime, Orange $31.60 $27.70 No Bid Disqualified

Kishigo 9110
Hi Vis Short Sleeve 

Shirt with pocket
Lime, Orange $24.90 No Bid No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

Wrangler 3W510AN

Wrangler Riggs 

Workwear Long Sleeve 

Button Down Denim 

Work Shirt

Antique $39.55 $36.65 No Bid Disqualified

E. Non-Fire Retardent Pants

Manufacturer Item/Style Number Description Color Options to Stock Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Wrangler

Wrangler VF Jeans 

Cowboy Cut Relaxed 

Fit

Dark Stone, Rigid 

Indigo, Prewashed 

Indigo

$35.10 $49.25 No Bid Disqualified

Levi's
Levi 501 Original Fit 

Jean

Dark Stone, Light 

Stone, Midstone, 

Rinsed Indigo Blue

$29.55 $61.00 No Bid Disqualified

Levi's
Levi's 505 Regular Fit 

Jeans

Dark Stone, Midstone, 

Rinse
$45.00 $54.65 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

F. Non-Fire Retardent Outerwear

Manufacturer Item/Style Number Description Color Options to Stock Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Tingley S78322

Tingley Job Sight 

Class 3 Pullover 

Hoodie

Fluorescent Yellow $56.70 $55.00 No Bid Disqualified

G. Office Wear

Manufacturer Item/Style Number Description Color Options to Stock Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Carhartt 103296
Carhartt Workwear 

Pocket T-Shirt
All Colors $23.35 No Bid No Bid Disqualified

Carhartt K570
Carhartt Midweight 

Short Sleeve Polo Shirt
All Colors $35.55 $33.10 No Bid Disqualified

Carhartt K84
Carhartt Short Sleeve 

Workwear Henley
All Colors $29.20 $28.60 No Bid Disqualified
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-259

  Title: Uniform Contract for Lakeland Electric Energy Delivery 

 Date: 7/31/2024

Bidder:

Wayne 

Enterprises, Inc

Tynsdale 

Enterprises, Inc Global Trading, Inc Tri-Sports LLC

City & State: Houston, TX Pipersville, PA Miami, FL Winter Park, FL

Nike 267020
Nike Dri-Fit Classic 

Short Sleeve Polo
All Colors $47.75 $47.55 No Bid Disqualified

Ogio OG101
Ogio Short Sleeve Polo 

Shirt
All Colors $33.30 $33.10 No Bid Disqualified

Nike 203690
Nike Tech Basic Dri-Fit 

Polo
All Colors $57.60 $59.25 No Bid Disqualified
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