
BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-222

  Title: Annual Disposal of Yard Waste, Class III, and Construction Demolition Material 

 Date: 4/4/2024

Bidder:

Republic Services of 

Florida, Limited 

Partnership

Angelos Recycled 

Materials BS Ranch and Farm

City & State: Lakeland, FL Lutz, FL Lakeland, FL

Pricing Per Ton

A. Yard Waste (Clean) $31.50 $45.00 $15.00

B. Yard Waste (Clean in Plastic or Paper Bags) $31.50 $45.00 $15.00

C. Construction & Demolition Debris (C&D) $31.50 $45.00 No Bid

D. Class III Waste $31.50 $45.00 No Bid

E. Tires $300.00 $175.00 No Bid

F. Tires w/Rims No Bid $275.00 No Bid

G. Total $426.00 $630.00 $30.00

H. Total Mileage from 605 Evelyn Ave to Bidder's Disposal Site
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BID TABULATION

CITY OF LAKELAND FLORIDA

PURCHASING AND STORES DIVISION

1140 E PARKER STREET

LAKELAND, FL. 33801

PHONE: (863) 834-6780  FAX:(863) 834-6777

Bid Number: 2024-ITB-222

  Title: Annual Disposal of Yard Waste, Class III, and Construction Demolition Material 

 Date: 4/4/2024

Bidder:

Republic Services of 

Florida, Limited 

Partnership

Angelos Recycled 

Materials BS Ranch and Farm

City & State: Lakeland, FL Lutz, FL Lakeland, FL

I. Yard Waste 12.0 3.9 6.0

J. Construction & Demolition Debris (C&D) 12.0 3.9 No Bid

K. Class III Waste 12.0 27.9 No Bid

L. Tires 5.5 27.9 No Bid
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